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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided aDer the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date :2001-07-01 Pages: 261 Publisher: China Agriculture Press title:
the Ministry of Agriculture in the 21st century. higher vocational planning materials: floriculture (Landscape
Horticulture and Forestry. class professional) List Price: 22.50 yuan of : Cao Chunying Press: China Agriculture
Press Publication Date :2001-07-01ISBN: 9787109070066 Number of words: Pages: 261 Edition: 1 Format: Folio: 16
open commodity Weight: Editor's Summary 21st Century Department of Agriculture Vocational College
planning materials: floriculture (Garden Horticulture and Forestry professional) is divided into 11 chapters. the
classification of flower cultivation environment. cultivation facilities. cultivation of cut flowers. potted plant
cultivation. the open field floriculture detailed. fully elaborated to increase valuable flower. Lunar New Year
flower cultivation and production operations and production management content. including cultivation
facilities. four major cut flowers and emerging cut flowers. potted flowers foliage and ornamental fruit.
expensive flowers. focus of the Lunar New Year flower cultivation techniques to enhance operability and
practicality. This material strive to make students from theory to practice. from production management to
business management. master set of technical skills. to develop their sense of innovation and entrepreneurship.
Floriculture is a garden flower the professional backbone lesson textbook also available for gardening
professional agronomic professional cultivation of professional professional and industry personnel use and
reference. Directory publishing written description of Introduction. the meaning and scope of floriculture.
floriculture significance. floriculture History. flowers germplasm resources in China five foreign flower industry
development status VI. China's flower industry outlook review Questions Chapter 1 Flower Classification Section
I biological traits classification. herbaceous flowers. woody floral. fleshy. succulent plants Section II press
viewing site classification. concept of spent flowers. ornamental flowers. concept stems of flowers and
ornamental fruit flowers and...
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